Bid Tabulation

ITB 13 - 18 (18017) "HEMATOLOGY SUPPLIES"
Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer
johnsonre@jccal.org

Allegiance Corporation Medline Supreme Medical
GRAND TOTAL $ 717.29363| $ 4,280.81429| $ 281.44196
PIPET SEROLOGICAL 2ML 500/CS | Mfg.: GLOBE SCIENTIFIC | Mfg. # 1720
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P4676-2 Globe Scientific Inc DLS1720 NO BID NO BID
! PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10001/CS @S} 500 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 129.22000 | $ 0.08000| $ 78.29000 | $ 0.15660 NO BID NO BID
Urinalysis Microscope Slide Kova® Glasstic® Slide 10 with Grid 10-Chamber Plain | Mfg.: Kova | Mfg. # 87144
BRAND/STK NO Kova U3050-18 Kova KVA87144 NO BID NO BID
2 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 100/PK PK 100 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 94.66700 | $ 0.09460| $ 119.23000 | $ 1.19230 NO BID NO BID
Rapid Diagnostic Test Kit QuickVue® hCG Combo Serum/Urine hCG Pregnancy Test Urine / Serum Sample CLIA Waived 50 Tests | Mfg.: Quidel | Mfg. # 20110
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal B1077-23 Quidel QDL20110A Quidel 20110
3 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 30/KIT KIT 50 EA/BX, 1 KT/BX N/A 50/PK 1PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 32.27000 | $ 1.07000] $ 128.37000 | $ 2.56740| $ 110.00000 | $ 2.20000
Urine Chemistry Control Set QuickVue® One-Step Pregnancy (hCG) Testing Positive / Negative 2 X 4.5 MI | Mfg.: Quidel | Mfg. # 00272
BRAND/STK NO Quidel B6775-14A Quidel QDL0272 Quidel $ 272.00000
4 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/EA EA 2 EA/BX, 1 CS/BX N/A EA 1PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 21.31000 | $ 21.31000| ¢ 29.37000 | $ 14.68500 | $ 25.60000 | $ 25.60000
Serum Control Set QuickVue® Pregnancy (hCG) Testing Negative / Low Positive / High Positive [Mfg.: Quidel | Mfg. # 00281
5 BRAND/STK NO Qui -28A Qu g =gl 281 —1
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/§A A 1 EA/K]. 1 l lN/A IEA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ A0 ¥ 5473000 § ; B0 1 6123000]$ ¥ 5438000
Microscope Slide McKesson 25 X 75 X 1 mm Plain | Mfg.: McKesson | Mfg.# 70-101PMCK
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH27101PX Medline MLABSLIDEP McKesson 70-101PMCK
6 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1440 EA/CS, 20
1440/CS CS BX/CS N/A 72/BX 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 68.25000 | $ 0.04740| $ 48.85000 | $ 0.03390| $ 7.02000| $ 0.09750
Microscope Slide 25 X 75 X 1 mm Frosted End | Mfg.: Globe Scientific | Mfg. # 1304
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH7105PX Globe Scientific Inc DLS1304 McKesson 70-105PMCK
7 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1440 EAJ/CS, 20
1440/CS CS BX/CS N/A 72/BX 1BX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 207.64700 | $ 0.04820] $ 90.00000 | $ 0.06250| $ 8.55000] $ 0.11880
Urine Reagent Strip Multistix® 10 SG Glucose, Bilirubin, Ketone, Specific Gravity, Blood, pH, Protein, Urobilinogen, Nitrite, Leucocytes 100 Strips | Mfg.: Siemens | Mfg. # 10336425
BRAND/STK NO Siemens U2604-2 Siemens AMV2161Z Siemens 10336425
8 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 100 EA/BT, 1BX/BT,
100/EA EA 1 PK/BT N/A 100/BX 1BX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 32.28000 | $ 0.32846| $ 54.04000 | $ 0.54040| $ 52.43000 | $ 0.52000
Trash Bag for Clinitek 500 Urinalysis Analyzer | Mfg.: Siemens | Mfg. # 10311542
BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Siemens AMV6472 NO BID NO BID
9 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1 PK/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID 3$ 11.97000 | $ 11.97000 NO BID NO BID

Prepared by: Regina Johnson, 02/22/2018 Page 1 of 12



Allegiance Corporation

Medline

Supreme Medical

GRAND TOTAL 3$ 717.29363| $ 4,280.81429| $ 281.44196
Halogen Lamp Osram 6 Volts 20 Watts | Mfg.: Bulbtronics | Mfg. # 0000861
BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Osram/Sylvania B-U0000861 NO BID NO BID
10 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 2.53000] $ 2.53000 NO BID NO BID
Capillary Blood Collection Tube Micro-hematocrit Plain 1.15 X 75 mm 75 pL Blue Stripe Without Closure Glass Tube | Mfg.: Globe Scientific| Mfg. # 51602
BRAND/STK NO Chase 2502A Globe Scientific Inc DLS51602 NO BID NO BID
11 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000 EA/CS, 10
2400/PK PK BX/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 75.43000 | $ 0.03100]| $ 33.64000 | $ 0.03364 NO BID NO BID
TUBE, CENTRIFUGE POLYN PLUG CAP 15ML (500/CS) | Mfg.: Stockwell Scientific| Mfg. # 8514
BRAND/STK NO Stockwell 8514 Stockwell SWwW8514 NO BID NO BID
12 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 500/CS @S} 500 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 34.42000 | $ 0.06884| $ 37.55000 | $ 0.07510 NO BID NO BID
Paper, Lens Paper, 4 X 6 Inch Optical Instrument Lens [Mfg.: Graham - Field | Mfg. # 3719
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P1055 Medline MLABLW4X6 Graham-Field 3719
13 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 50/BOOK, 12
50/PD; 12PD/PK PK 12 EA/PK N/A BOOKS/PK 1PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 9.23000] $ 0.01538| $ 19.38000 | $ 1.61500] $ 9.37000| $ 0.78080
IDENTI-TRAY, CRITOSEAL (6/PK) |[Mfg.: VWR | Mfg. # 18000-299
BRAND/STK NO Leica MS215003CA McCormick Scientific MCF215003 NO BID NO BID
14 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/PK PK 36 TR/CS, 6 PK/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 18.17000 | $ 18.17000 | $ 144.68000 | $ 4.01889 NO BID NO BID
ICTOTEST TAB 100TST/BX 100/BX 6BX/CS URINE DIPSTICK | Mfg.: Siemens | Mfg. # 10337316
BRAND/STK NO See line 85 See line 85 Siemens AMV25917 NO BID NO BID
15 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER
See line 85 See line 85 100 EA/BX, 1 PK/BX N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See line 85 See line 85 $ 61.73000 | $ 0.61730 NO BID NO BID
PLATE, HOLD DOWN F/CLINITEX ADVANTAS URINALYSIS ANALYZ |Mfg.: Siemens| Mfg. # 10713955
BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cappers™ Tube Closure Polyethylene Dual Tab Blue For 13 mm Glass Evacuated Blood Drawing Tube / 12 mm Plastic Test Tube NonSterile [Mfg.: Globe Scientific| Mfg. # 1131408
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal T1226-37 Globe Scientific Inc DLS113140B NO BID NO BID
17 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000/PK PK 1000 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 33.09000 | $ 0.03309] $ 31.30000 | $ 0.03130 NO BID NO BID
Cappers™ Tube Closure Polyethylene Dual Tab Lavender For 13 mm Glass Evacuated Blood Drawing Tube / 12 mm Plastic Test Tube NonSterile | Mfg.: Globe Scientific | Mfg. # 113140L
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal SP1290-3 Globe Scientific Inc DLS113140L NO BID NO BID
18 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000/CS @S} 1000 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 21.65000 | $ 0.02165| $ 32.33000 | $ 0.03233 NO BID NO BID
Power Duster, 10 oz Can |[Mfg.: Perfect Duster | Mfg. # PDC - 1058421
BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Decon Labs, Inc. QDE3711 NO BID NO BID
19 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 6 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID 3$ 74.25000 | $ 12.37500 NO BID NO BID
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Allegiance Corporation Medline Supreme Medical
GRAND TOTAL 3$ 717.29363| $ 4,280.81429| $ 281.44196

CLEANER, LENS OPTICAL BO 59ML (6/PK) |[Mfg.: Fisher| Mfg. # S66878

BRAND/STK NO
20 Cardinal M6015 LW Scientific LWCMSPCLN7LEN NO BID NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 6/BT EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 3.02000| $ 1.72500] $ 8.85000] $ 8.85000 NO BID NO BID

Laboratory Label General Alert DATE / / OPENED Fluorescent Chartreuse 3/4 Inch Diameter | Mfg.: Shamrock Scientific | Mfg. # UPCR-9900

BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKA0321 NO BID NO BID
21 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID 3$ 35.34000 | $ 0.03534 NO BID NO BID

LABEL, NEW LOT DO NOT USE FLRCNT ORG (500/RL) [Mfg.: Shamrock Scientific | Mfg.# UPCR-3007

BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKAB8030 NO BID NO BID
22 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID 3$ 70.97000 | $ 0.07097 NO BID NO BID

LABEL DO NOT USE RL=EA | Mfg.: Market Lab | Mfg. # 8032

BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKAB8032 NO BID NO BID
23 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID 3$ 49.82000 | $ 0.04982 NO BID NO BID

Laboratory Label Patient Alert NAME ALERT Fluorescent Red 5-16 X 1-1/4 Inch |[Mfg.: Shamrock Scientific | Mfg.# UPCR-1020

BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKA9097 NO BID NO BID
24 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID 3$ 38.27000 | $ 0.03827 NO BID NO BID

Hematology Control Cell-Chex™ Cell Body Fluid Spinal and Body Fluid 2 Levels 4 X 2 MI | Mfg.: Streck Laboratories | Mfg. # 212420

BRAND/STK NO Streck B3160-61 Streck SQK212420 NO BID NO BID
% PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 2ml/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 139.00000 | $ 69.50000 | $ 225.01000 | $ 225.01000 NO BID NO BID

Decon*Contrad* Instrument Detergent Liquid 1 Liter Bottle |[Mfg.: Fisher | Mfg. # 4355

BRAND/STK NO Decon Labs C6501-1 Decon Labs, Inc. QDE1002 NO BID NO BID
26 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 405.720z/CS CS 12 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 215.00000 | $ 0.52990| $ 214.23000 | $ 17.85250 NO BID NO BID

OIL IMMERSION HIGH VISC 16 OZ | Mfg.: Richard Allan Scientific | Mfg. # M5004

BRAND/STK NO Richard Allan M6005-16H] Azer Scientific AZRES3030 NO BID NO BID
27 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1920z/CS @S} 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 195.30000 | $ 1.10719] $ 67.49000 | $ 67.49000 NO BID NO BID

OIL IMMERSION LOW VISC 16 OZ | Mfg.: Richard Allan Scientific | Mfg. # M5000

BRAND/STK NO Richard Allan M6005-16L.O Azer Scientific AZRES3024 NO BID NO BID
28 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1920z/CS @S} 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 191.87000 | $ 0.99900| $ 62.81000 | $ 62.81000 NO BID NO BID

METHANOL S/P 1 GAL | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # C4324

BRAND/STK NO Cardinal C4324 Medline MCHEM150 NO BID NO BID
29 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 5120z/CS @S} 4 EAICS N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 70.27000 | $ 0.11629| $ 74.00000 | $ 18.50000 NO BID NO BID

SPINAL DILUTING FLUID, 4 OZ., | Mfg.: Ricca Chemical Co. | 7996-4

BRAND/STK NO Ricca 7996-4 Ricca RCCR7996500A NO BID NO BID
30 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 120ml/CS EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 17.17200 | $ 0.14310| $ 27.68000 | $ 27.68000 NO BID NO BID

PAPER BLEED BLOTTING SURGICUTT | Mfg.: Int. Technidyne Corp. | Mfg. # SUP100I
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Allegiance Corporation Medline Supreme Medical
GRAND TOTAL 3 717.29363| $ 4,280.81429] $ 281.44196

BRAND/STK NO ITC B4237-50 Accriva Diagnostics ITCSUP100 NO BID NO BID

31 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 50/PK PK 100 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 187.53000 | $ 3.74000] $ 166.29000 | $ 1.66290 NO BID NO BID
CELL-CHEX 4X2ML L1-UC L2 | MFg.: Streck Laboratories | MFg. # 212420
BRAND/STK NO Streck B212431 Streck SQK212420 NO BID NO BID

32 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 6mI/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 84.82000 | $ 1413700 $ 225.01000 | $ 225.01000 NO BID NO BID
TUBE SHIELD MEDISPIN | Mfg.: Kendro Laboratory Products | Mfg. # 015050R
BRAND/STK NO Kendro C1504-12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/EA EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 2250000 $ 22.50000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MAS UA LEVEL 1 60ML | Mfg.: Microgenics | Mfg. # UAB-160
BRAND/STK NO Thermo Fisher

34 Microgenics UAB-160 Scientific MLVUAB160 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 240ml/PK PK 4 EAIPK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 94.76000 | $ 0.39483| $ 938.25000 | $ 234.56250 NO BID NO BID
MAS UA Level 2 60mL |Mfg.: Microgenics | Mfg. # UAB - 260
BRAND/STK NO Thermo Fisher

35 Microgenics UAB-260 Scientific MLVUAB260 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 240ml/PK PK 4 EAIPK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 94.76000 | $ 0.39483| $ 938.02500 | $ 234.56250 NO BID NO BID
7/31/2017 UB6017071 KIT UA CTL L1 4X60ML |Mfg.: Microgenics | Mfg. # UAB-160707
BRAND/STK NO Thermo Fisher

36 Microgenics UAB-160707 Scientific MLVUAB160 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 240ml/PK PK 4 EAIPK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 94.76000 | $ 0.39483| $ 938.25000 | $ 234.56250 NO BID NO BID
7/31/2017 UB6017072 KIT UA CTL L2 4X60ML | Mfg.: Microgenics | Mfg. # UAB-260707
BRAND/STK NO Thermo Fisher

37 Microgenics UAB-260707 Scientific MLVUAB260 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 240ml/PK PK 4 EAIPK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 94.76000 | $ 0.39483| $ 938.25000 | $ 234.56250 NO BID NO BID
COMBO KIT 90010 90025 80025 | Mfg.: Enterix, Inc. | Mfg. # 90035
BRAND/STK NO Clinical Genomics

38 Enterix 90035 Technologies PTY EIG90035 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 25/BX BX 35 EA/KT N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 189.74000 | $ 7.58960| $ 211.33000| $ 6.03800 NO BID NO BID
FOBT CONTROLS TWO BOTTLE ONE POS ONE NEG | Mfg.: Enterix, Inc. | Mfg. # 16800
BRAND/STK NO Clinical Genomics

39 Enterix 16800 Technologies PTY EIG16800 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 2/BX BX 2 EA/BX N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 64.68600 | $ 32.34000| $ 84.53000 | $ 42.26500 NO BID NO BID
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INSURE FIT DEVELOPER KIT 25 TESTS | Mfg.: Enterix, Inc. | 80025B
BRAND/STK NO Clinical Genomics
40 Enterix 80025B Technologies PTY EIG80025 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 25/BX BX 25 EA/KT N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 187.48000 | $ 7.49000| $ 161.78000 | $ 6.47120 NO BID NO BID
INSURE FIT 10 PACK COLLECTION KIT | Mfg.: Enterix, Inc. | Mfg. # 900100
BRAND/STK NO Clinical Genomics
41 Enterix 90010 Technologies PTY EIG90010 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10/BX BX 10 EA/KT N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 25.00000 | $ 2.50000| $ 32.32000 | $ 3.23200 NO BID NO BID
INSURE FIT 25 PACK COLLECTION KIT | Mfg.: Enterix | Mfg. # 90025
BRAND/STK NO Clinical Genomics
42 Enterix 90025 Technologies PTY EIG90025 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 25/BX BX 25 EA/KT N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 78.71500 | $ 3.14860| $ 71.11000 | $ 2.84440 NO BID NO BID
TABLET ACETEST REAGENT | Mfg.: Ascensia Diabetes Care US, Inc. | Mfg. # 2381
BRAND/STK NO Ascendia U2620-1C Biorex Labs, LLC BXXB1555 NO BID NO BID
43 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 100/BX BX 100 EA/BT NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 29.75000 | $ 0.29750| $ 34.81000 | $ 0.34810 NO BID NO BID
SWAB CLEANING VALIDATION KNIT POLYESTER | Mfg. Texwipe | Mfg. # TX761
BRAND/STK NO Conneticut Clean
Texwipe S1202-2 Room Corp. CCXTX761 NO BID NO BID
44 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000 EA/CS, 10
1000/CS @S| BG/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 226.41000 | $ 0.22641| $ 432.99000 | $ 0.43299 NO BID NO BID
WIPE BIOHAZ SUPER ABSORBENT 4X4 S/P | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # BH90044
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal A9495-2 Marketlab Inc MKA1073 Cardinal BH90044
45 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 7200/CS @S} 2000 EA/PK N/A 100 WIPES/CS 1CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 82.28200 | $ 0.01000| $ 184.82000 | $ 0.09241| $ 114.99000 | $ 0.06270
WIPE BIOHAZ SUPER ABSORBENT 3X3 S/P | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # BH91033
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal A9495-1 Marketlab Inc MKA1073 Cardinal BH91033
46 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1800/CS @S} 2000 EA/PK N/A 1800 WIPES/CS 1CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 71.41000 | $ 0.03900| $ 184.82000 | $ 0.09241| $ 96.95000 | $ 0.05386
EZEE-NEST SAMPLE CUPS 13MM | Mfg.: Tyco Healthcare \ Kendall | Mfg. # 1270013000
BRAND/STK NO Tyco 1270013000 Globe Scientific Inc DLS5504 Kendall/Tyco 1270013000
4 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 5000/CS CS 1000 EA/CS N/A 1000/PK 1PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 219.00000 | $ 0.04280| $ 26.86000 | $ 0.02686| $ 26.29000 | $ 0.02630
REAGENT LIPOCLEAR 0.5ML SAMPLE | Mfg. Hemocue America | Mfg.# LC40
BRAND/STK NO Hemocue B8900-46 Beckman Coulter Inc B-CLC40 NO BID NO BID
48 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 20ml/BG BG 40 EA/BG N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 156.00000 | $ 7.80000| $ 201.41000 | $ 5.03525 NO BID NO BID
DRUG TEST 1 PANEL | Mfg.: Medtox Scientific | Mfg. # 601598
BRAND/STK NO Medtox 102638 Alere Toxicology DRUGCASMAMP NO BID NO BID
49 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER BX BX 25 EA/BX N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 17.00000 | $ 17.00000 | $ 49.36000 | $ 1.97440 NO BID NO BID
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Allegiance Corporation Medline Supreme Medical
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CONTROL EXTERNAL MEDTOX NEGATIVE DEVICE | Mfg.: Medtox Scientific | Mfg. # 101183
BRAND/STK NO Medtox SP101183 Alere Toxicology DRUGB88002 NO BID NO BID
50 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 5mlI/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 18.50000 | $ 3.70000| $ 4529000 | $ 45.29000 NO BID NO BID
2X POSITIVE CONTROL FOR MEDTOX PRODUCTS | Mfg.: Medtox Scientific | Mfg. # 102368
BRAND/STK NO Medtox 102368 Alere Toxicology DRUGB88003 NO BID NO BID
51 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/BT BT 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 23.18600 | $ 23.18600 | $ 67.79000 | $ 67.79000 NO BID NO BID
CAP CLOSURE SP VERSA UNIVERSAL NATURAL | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # A20007ALG
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal B2996-60 Globe Scientific Inc DLS118115C NO BID NO BID
52 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10,000/CS CS 1000 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 561.34000 | $ 0.05600| $ 19.34000 | $ 0.01934 NO BID NO BID
TOP SNAP CAP CLOSURE RED FOR 13MM | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # B3035-81V
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal B3035-81V Globe Scientific Inc DLS113142R NO BID NO BID
53 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10,000/CS @S} 1000 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 116.21400 | $ 0.01162| $ 39.26000 | $ 0.03926 NO BID NO BID
HOLDER TUBE MICROTAINER | Mfg.: Becton Dickinson | Mfg. # 366270
BRAND/STK NO BD B2975-60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000/CS CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 74.87000 | $ 0.07487 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WIPER DISP 4 1/2INX8 1/2IN KIMWIPES WHT | Mfg.: Kimberly Clark Prof. Hithcr. | Mfg. # 34155
BRAND/STK NO Kimberly Clark C6395-1A NO BID NO BID KC 34155
55 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 16800/CS @S} NO BID NO BID 280/BX 1BX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 70.14000 | $ 0.00418 NO BID NO BID $ 2.79000 0.01000
DERMACEA 2X2 12PLY NS | Mfg.: Tyco Healthcare / Kendall | Mfg. # 441218
BRAND/STK NO Kimberly Clark KC441218A NO BID NO BID Kendall/Tyco 441218
56 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 8000/CS CS NO BID NO BID 200/PK, 40PK/CS 1PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 82.64000 | $ 0.01937 NO BID NO BID 3$ 45.20000 0.00570
TOP SNAP CAP CLOSURE BLUE FOR 13MM | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # B3035-82V
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal B3035-82V Globe Scientific Inc DLS1131408 NO BID NO BID
57 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000/PK PK 1000 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 53.04000 | $ 0.05340| $ 31.30000 | $ 0.03130 NO BID NO BID
TIP MLA STACKED RACK SM 1000PK | Mfg.: Vistalab Technologies, Inc. | Mfg. # 9025
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P5048-40 Vistalab Technologies VLT9025 NO BID NO BID
58 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10000/CS @S} 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 364.10000 | $ 0.03641| $ 62.16000 | $ 0.06216 NO BID NO BID
TIP PIPET DISP MLA STCK RK L | Vistalab Technologies, Inc. | Mfg. # 9026
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P5048-43 Vistalab Technologies CLT9026 NO BID NO BID
59 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 6000/CS @S} 600 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 240.18000 | $ 0.04003| $ 4555000 | $ 0.07592 NO BID NO BID
PARAFILM 4IN WIDE 125FT/ROLL | Mfg.: Curwood (A division of Bemis CO. , Inc.) | Mfg. # PM996
BRAND/STK NO Curwood P1150-2 Bemis MFG BMTPM996 NO BID NO BID
60 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 12 BX/CS, 12 EA/CS,
125ft/EA EA 12 RL/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 15.11000 | $ 0.12088| $ 320.18000 | $ 26.68167 NO BID NO BID
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PIPET SEROLOGICAL 10ML NO PLUG NONSTERLE | Mfg. Corning Life Sciences | Mfg. # 7079-10N
BRAND/STK NO Thermo Fisher
61 Corning P4685-29 Scientific MLV707910N NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 120/PK PK 720 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 81.68500 | $ 0.68071| $ 346.15000 | $ 0.48076 NO BID NO BID
RACK UNWIRE TEST TUBE BLUE 13MM | Mfg.: Nalge NUNC International | Mfg.# 5970-0313
BRAND/STK NO Thermo Fisher
62 Nalge S9248-13B Scientific MLV59700313 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 8/CS CS 1 PK/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 373.10000 | $ 37.31000| $ 22.95000 | $ 22.95000 NO BID NO BID
PIPETTE MLA MACRO 3ML | Mfg.: Vistalab Technologies | Mfg. # 1067
63 BRAND/STK NO MLA P5066-3A Vistalab Technologies VLT1067 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 204.98000 | $ 204.98000| $ 327.55000 | $ 327.55000 NO BID NO BID
TIP PIPETTE SP 1000-5000UL MLA NAT BK | Mfg. Cardinal Health | Mfg. # 090-8
64 BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P5049-26 Globe Scientific Inc DLS151244 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 250/PK PK 250 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 15.41300 | $ 0.06165| $ 20.10000 | $ 0.08040 NO BID NO BID
TIP MLA MACRO GRAD 1-5ML 100PK | Mfg.: Vistalab Technologies | Mfg.# 9048
65 BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P5078-900 Vistalab Technologies VLT9048 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 100/PK PK 100 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 26.31000 | $ 0.26312| $ 30.10000 | $ 0.30100 NO BID NO BID
CARD RPR 18MM CONTROL | Mfg.: Beckton Dickinson Diagnostic Systems | Mfg. # 276709
66 BRAND/STK NO BD 43276709 BD BDD276709 BD 276709
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10/PK PK 10 EA/BX N/A 10/BX 1BX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 38.57000 | $ 3.86100| $ 57.15000 | $ 5.71500 50.79000 5.07900
Kit RPR Card Test No 110 500 Tests | Mfg.: Becton Dickinson Diagnostic Systems | Mfg. # 275005
67 BRAND/STK NO BD B6940-10 BD BDD275005 BD 275005
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 500/KIT KIT 1 EA/EA N/A 500/BX 1BX
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 229.80000 | $ 0.45961| $ 284.44000 | $ 284.44000 267.13000 0.53430
AMPULE RPR CARD ANTIGEN SUSPENSION 3ML | Mfg.: Becton Dickinson Diagnostic Systems | Mfg. # 270309
68 BRAND/STK NO BD B6940-3A BD BDD270309 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10/SP SP 10 EA/BX N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 258.81000 | $ 25.58000 | $ 856.82000 | $ 85.68200 NO BID NO BID
TEST QUICKVUE 30S H PYLORI GlI | Mfg.: Quidel Corp. | Mfg.# 0W010
BRAND/STK NO Quidel B1042-49 Quidel QDLOWO010 Quidel 0W010
69 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 30 EA/BX, 30
30/KIT KIT KT/BX N/A 30/PK 1PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 318.14800 | $ 10.60000 | $ 404.25000 | $ 13.47500 316.59000 10.55300
PIPET GEN PURPOSE 3.2ML DRAW | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # P5214-10V
20 BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P5214-10V Medline MLABTP7GRADZ NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 500/PK PK 500 EA/BX N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 8.26200( $ 0.01652| $ 9.19000( $ 0.01838 NO BID NO BID
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TIMER S/P TRACEABLE STANDUP BLACK 1/EA | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # 5022
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal C6511-1 Bel-Art Products BRT575EA NO BID NO BID
n PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 15.43000 | $ 15.43000 | $ 38.58000 | $ 38.58000 NO BID NO BID
TUBE CULTURE DISPO BORO 12X75MM S/P | Mfg.: Cardinal Health | Mfg. # SP1290-3
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal SP1290-3 Medline MLAB12X75B NO BID NO BID
72 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000 EA/CS, 4
1000/CS CS BX/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 21.65000 | $ 0.02205| $ 27.11000 | $ 0.02711 NO BID NO BID
PROTOCOL Hema-G Liquid Buffer 1 gal | Mfg. Fisher | Mfg. # 23-247058
73 BRAND/STK NO Cardinal B4136-3A NO BID NO BID Fisher 23-247058
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 10/PK PK NO BID NO BID EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 98.43000 | $ 8.20000 NO BID NO BID 3 44.38000| $ 44.38000
Cargille Immersion Oil Type A 16 oz |Mfg. Fisher | Mfg. #12-368B
74 BRAND/STK NO See line 27 See line 27 Azer Scientific AZRES3024 Fisher 12-368B
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER See line 27 See line 27 1 EA/EA N/A EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See line 27 See line 27 $ 62.81000 | $ 62.81000 | S 64.30000 | $ 64.30000
Cargille Immersion Oil Type B 16 oz | Mfg. Fisher | Mfg. #12-369B
75 |BRAND/STK NO See Lmag8 g gadine 28 g/ ige3030 FiP 698
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER Seeffine Sfe line 28 I IN/A A 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH Sce a5l Sl line 28 40 ¥ 6749000]3 oBoN & T 7003000
Microhematocrit Centrifuge Cushions | Mrg. IEC | Mfg. #1505
BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pipets, Disposable Plastic Serological | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. # P4676-1X
77 BRAND/STK NO Cardinal P4676-1X Globe Scientific Inc DLS1710 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000/CS CS 1000 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 3$ 191.51000 | $ 0.14695 | $ 149.64000 | $ 0.14964 NO BID NO BID
Hyaluronidase Type V, lyophilized >1,500 units/mg | Mfg. Sigma | Mfg. # H6254 CAS37326-33-3 ECN 3.2.1.35
78 BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Andwin Scientific AWNNC9765803 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 108.93000 | $ 108.93000 NO BID NO BID
KOVA Glasstic slide 10 100/pkg 87146 | Mfg. Cardinal| Mfg.# U3050-16
79 BRAND/STK NO Kova U3050-16 Kova KVA87146 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 100/PK PK 100 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 74.96000 | $ 0.74960 | $ 124.44000 | $ 1.24440 NO BID NO BID
KOVA Glasstic slide 10 w/ grids 100/pkg 87144 | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg.# U3050-18
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH3050-18 Medline MLAB87144 NO BID NO BID
80 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000 EA/CS, 10
Q 100/PK PK PK/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 94.66000 | $ 0.94660 | $ 624.58000 | $ 0.62458 NO BID NO BID
QuickVue+ hCG Combo Test Kit 50 tests/kit | Mfg. Quidel | Mfg.# 20110
81 BRAND/STK NO Cardinal B1077-23 Quidel QDL20110A Quidel 20110
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 30/BX BX 50 EA/BX, 1 KT/BX N/A 50/PK 1PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 32.26700 | $ 1.07000 | $ 128.37000 | $ 2.56740 | $ 110.00000 | $ 2.20000

Slides, Plain Bevel Edge 3x1x1 72/pk 20pk/cs | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg.# M6146-3A
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82 BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH27101PX General Data Co GDASMPTT45 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1440/CS CS 1440 EAICS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 68.25000 | $ 0.04740 | $ 97.81000 | $ 0.06792 NO BID NO BID
Slides, Superfrost Silver Label 3x1 10 gr/cs | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. M6146
BRAND/STK NO Cardinal CH7105PX Medline MLABSLIDEF NO BID NO BID

83 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1440 EAICS, 20

1440/CS cs BX/CS N/A NO BID NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 69.40800 | $ 0.04820 | $ 50.68000 | $ 0.03519 NO BID NO BID
Surgicutt Bleeding Time Blotting Paper 150/pkg | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg.# B4238

84 BRAND/STK NO ITC B4238 Accriva Diagnostics ITCSUP100 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 100/BX BX 100 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 166.30600 | $ 1.20000 | $ 166.29000 | $ 1.66290 NO BID NO BID
Ictotest 100/btl | Mfg.Cardinal | Mfg.# U2515-1

85 BRAND/STK NO Siemens U2515-1 Siemens AMV25917 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 100/BT BT 100 EA/BX, 1 PK/BX N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 51.51000 | $ 0.51514 | $ 61.73000 | $ 0.61730 NO BID NO BID
Streck ESR Chex Bilevel 12x9 mL #214112 | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg.# B3600-7

86 BRAND/STK NO Strec -7 Stre, S 4112 NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 108mifEA A 12E JB)Q N /A N O BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ RS 1 3.01308 [ $ SN T | 4371083 N BDD
Urine Control Level 1 (Urinalysis) 4x60 mL | Mfg. Dade Behri_ng | Mfg # B5162-1

87 BRAND/STK NO NO %Nﬂ N D Quantimetrix Co; OMX 148141 NO D
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO N(IBID 1 BX/KTﬁ EW*% /A NO@ BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO IV 1 INgBD $ WP 4 ¥ 149.96000 NO BID
Urine Control Level 2 (Urinalysis) 4x60 mL | Mfg. Dade Behring | Mfa.# B5162-2

88 BRAND/STK NO NOB NQRID Quantimetrix Corp QMX148241 NOB D
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO NJBD 1BXKT, B NOpD BD
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO I ¥V 1 INdBD $ 1 J129.96000 NONLL BID
Reagent A-Rinse Reagent 500 ml | Mfg. Wescor | Mfg. # SS-035A, NO SUBSTITUTES

89 BRAND/STK NO ElitechGroup SS-035A Elitech Group V-TSS034AG NOBID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 16.90z/EA EA 1BX/KT, 1 EA/KT N/A NOBID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 23.45500 | $ 1.38787 | $ 169.62000 | $ 169.62000 NO BID NO BID
Sample Chamber, White 48/pkg | Mfg. Wescor | Mfg. #SS-113, NO SUBSTITUTES

90 BRAND/STK NO ElitechGroup SS-113 Wescor Inc V-TSS113 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 48/BX BX 48 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 153.96000 | $ 3.20750 | $ 216.75000 | $ 4.51563 NO BID NO BID
Sample Chamber, Tan 48/pkg | Mfg. Wescor | Mfg. #SS-114, NO SUBSTITUTES

01 BRAND/STK NO ElitechGroup SS-114 Wescor Inc V-TSS114 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 48/BX BX 48 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 148.72000 | $ 3.09830 | $ 216.75000 | $ 4.51563 NO BID NO BID
Reagent B-Thiazin Stain 500 ml | Mfg. Wescor | Mfg. #SS-035/049B, NO SUBSTITUTES

9 BRAND/STK NO ElitechGroup SS035049B Wescor Inc MLVSS035049BG NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 16.90z/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 21.33000 | $ 1.26231 | $ 218.18000 | $ 218.18000 NO BID NO BID
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Reagent C-Eosin Stain 500 ml | Mfg. Wescor | Mfg. #SS-035C, NO SUBSTITUTES
93 BRAND/STK NO ElitechGroup SS-035C Elitech Group V-TSS035CG NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 16.90z/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 23.45500 | $ 1.38700 | $ 172.85000 | $ 172.85000 NO BID NO BID
Aerofix Additive 60 ml | Mfg. Wescor | Mfg. #SS-148, NO SUBSTITUTES
94 BRAND/STK NO ElitechGroup SS-148 Elitech Group V-TSS148 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 4.560z/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 60.10400 | $ 13.18000 | $ 71.40000 | $ 71.40000 NO BID NO BID
Aerospray Nozzle Cleaning 355 ml | Mfg. Wescor | Mfg. #SS-029, NO SUBSTITUTES
95 BRAND/STK NO ElitechGroup SS-029 Wescor Inc V-TSS029 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/EA EA 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 48.08800 | $ 48.08800 | $ 53.42000 | $ 53.42000 NO BID NO BID
Multistick 10 Urinalysis Test Strip | Mfg. Bayer | Mfg. #U2604-2
BRAND/STK NO See line 8 See line 8 Siemens AMV21617 NO BID
96 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER seeliffe
N/A NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See line & _ See line 8 0.54040 NO BID
Clinitex 500 Waste Bin Liners | Mfg. Bayer | Mfg. #6472
97 BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Siemens AMV6472 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1 PK/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 11.97000 | $ 11.97000 NO BID NO BID
Light Bulb, ESB/EHE 6v | Mfg. Light Bulb Depot | Mfg. #8361A
98 BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Plain Capillary Tubes | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. #P5066-15
BRAND/STK NO Chase 2502A Drummond Scientific| DMNO0007500C5 NO BID NO BID
99 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1000 EA/CS, 5
2000/CS CS VL/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 75.43000 | $ 0.03143 [ $ 57.66000 | $ 0.03766 NO BID NO BID
Streck Body Fluid QC | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. #B3160-61
BRAND/STK NO See LigingS g Sadgmine 25 Stre SQE212420 NO BID
100 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER See [fine ISe Line 25 1 EQUEA] N [N/A N@B O BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH Sce Lmae>5 I W ¥ Usedline 25 $ 1800 4 255.01000 N | NOBD
Critoseal, Capillary Tube Sealant, 6 trays of sealant per pack | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. #MS215003A
101 BRAND/STK NO SeeLig™N N I A F=me 14 McCormic clapy 5003 NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER SeeLifge 1 N Becfinc 14 36 TR/CY 6P | /A N@B OBD
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See Lin ¥ XeeWine 14 $ SN ES 4.01889 N O BID
Ezee Topper Protective Caps 13mm, 1000/pkg, blue | Mfg.
102 BRAND/STK NO See Lipag7 Eiﬁ_me 57 Globe Scie RISl 142B NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER Scc Ifine SefLine 57 1000 | I NOJBID BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See Se¥Line 57 $ sU 0 ¥ 004247 NOQWY TV 11 NoBD
Ezee Topper Protective Caps 13mm, 1000/pkg, lavender | Mfg. #B3035-85
BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Globe Scientific Inc DLS113142L NO BID NO BID
103 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NOBID NO BID 1000 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 39.26000 | $ 0.03926 NO BID NO BID

Microduster IlI refillable gas duster, refill can, 6/case | Mfg.
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104 BRAND/STK NO Ictote C6417-87 Decon Labs, Inc. QE3711 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 6/BX BX 6 EA/CS N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 65.47000 | $ 10.91250 | $ 74.25000 | $ 12.37500 NO BID NO BID
Cardinal S/P lens cleaner, 2 fl oz | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. M6015

105 BRAND/STK NO See Line 20 See Line 20 LW Scientific LWCMSPCLN7LEN NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER See Line 20 See Line 20 1 EA/EA N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See Line 20 See Line 20 $ 8.85000 | $ 8.85000 NO BID NO BID
Open Date Labels | Mfg. Marketlab | Mfg. #ML7839

106 BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKA7839 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 50.08000 | $ 0.05008 NO BID NO BID
Last in Box Labels | Mfg. Marketlab | Mfg. #ML9109
BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKA9109 NO BID NO BID

107
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 44.16000 | $ 0.04416 NO BID NO BID
New Lot Labels | Mfg. Marketlab | Mfg. #ML9106

108 BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKA9106 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 45.30000 | $ 0.04530 NO BID NO BID
Do Not Use This Lot Labels | Mfg. Marketlab | Mfg. #ML8032

109 BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKAB8032 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 49.82000 | $ 0.04982 NO BID NO BID
Name Alert Labels | Mfg. Marketlab | Mfg. #ML9097

110 BRAND/STK NO NO BID NO BID Marketlab Inc MKA9097 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER NO BID NO BID 1000 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH NO BID NO BID $ 38.27000 | $ 0.03827 NO BID NO BID
Insure Fit Test Cards for QC 50 Pack | Mfg. Enteri | Mfg. #11018
BRAND/STK NO Clinical Genomics

111 Enterix 11018 Technologies PTY EIG11018 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 50/BX BX 50 EA/PK N/A NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 91.00000 | $ 1.82000 | $ 89.56000 | $ 1.79120 NO BID NO BID
Insure Fit 10 Pack Collection Kit | Mfg. Enterix |Mfg. #90010
BRAND/STK NO Clinical Genomics

112 S‘EFine 41 Technolog 1) A ETPeL0 NO AlA D
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER SeffLine 41 10 EAKT \ l ' I 'i/A NOBID BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH Sel Line 41 $ 52000 TS 3.32320 NO BID
Protocol Hema-G-buffer 1gal | Mfg. Fisher | Mfg. #23-247058

113 BRAND/STK NO See Ligrel3 Sn‘ﬁ%ne 73 NO% b3 [D NO B
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER SecTfne B SefLine 73 NO BID ﬁ Np BD NO D
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See Lwef3 0 W ¥ Wscl1ine 73 NO 1 1 1 NDBD NO
Gauze, 2x2, Non-sterile, 12-ply bulk, | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. # KC441218A

114 BRAND/STK NO See Line 56 See Line 56 NO BID NO BID Dynarex 3223
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER See Line 56 See Line 56 NO BID NOBID 200/BAG 1 BAG
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH See Line 56 See Line 56 NO BID NO BID 1.21000 | $ 0.01000
Transfer Pipets | Mfg. Cardinal | Mfg. # P5214-10V

+1c  IBRAND/STK NO | Seclige 7R o @ wmya Line 70 Medjng m | ally\Bg/GRADZ | NOBRQL o | a o @80
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** |PKG QTY/MIN ORDER SeffLin}y A\ / fec Line 70 o BYINU/T T B2 NOFDY | BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH SALED Y fecLine 70 $ oM 4§ | 001838 NOND/ | BID
DISCOUNT FOR ALL NON-CORE ITEMS:
ALL OTHERITEMS SHALLBEATA__ %
ABOVE MANUFACTURERS COST TO VENDOR. 8% 0% 25%
REQUIRED FORMS
Notification of Intent to Respond NO YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES YES
Statement of Compliance YES YES YES
Signature Page YES YES YES
Price Sheet YES YES YES
Evaluation Questions NO YES NO
Addendum | NO NO YES
Addendum 11 NO YES YES
Addendum 111 NO YES YES
Addendum IV NO NO NO
CONTACT INFORMATION
Allegiance Corporation, DBA Cardinal 7000 Cardinal Place, Dublin, OH 43017 | Linda Gregg P: 800.964.5227 E: www. Cardinal.com
Medline Industries, Inc. Three Lakes Drive, Northfield, IL 60093 | Michael O'Ryan P: 847.643.4928 E: www.medline.com
Supreme Medical 4497 Dawes Rd, Mobile, AL 36582 | Cody Mason P: 251.660.6000 E:www.suprememedical.com
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